
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Confidential - For Settlement Purposes Only - LSJE, LLC v. Sportis SA and Tadeusz Zygowski 

Date: Sun, 26 Jul 2015 03:25:06 +0000 

yes, but maybe we should ship to florida instead , send me recent photos of boat 

On Sat, Jul 25, 2015 at 8:36 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
Please advise if I should accept that we pay for shipment of boat back to LSJ 
Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
Tel 212-971-1306 
Fax 646-350-0954 
Cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Adam Zygowski"
Date: July 25, 2015 at 4:44:44 PM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn"
Subject: Re: Confidential - For Settlement Purposes Only - LSJE, LLC v. Sportis SA and Tadeusz 
Zygowski 

We will not charge you for storing of the boat, if you collect the boat and ship it to USVI at your own cost. 
The boat with trailer could be prepared for transport within few days. 

Adam Zygowski 

W dniu .07.2015 o 14:50 Richard Kahn < 

can we discuss your email this am 

i am available this am if you can call 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

pisze: 
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New York, NY 10022 

tel 212-971-1306 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 917-414-7584 

On Jul 22, 2015, at 5:52 AM, Adam Zygowski < > wrote: 

Darren, 

We are astonished by your last proposal which is totally unacceptable for us. 

We do not agree either to participate in the freight costs nor equip the boat with engines at our cost. 

You misuse our good will, therefore we are forced to charge you for storing of the boat since 24th October 
2014 i.e. date when the boat was ready for collection. 

The storing fee is 45 EURO per day, so totally 272 days gives the amount 12.240 EURO. 

Adam Zygowski 

W dniu .07.2015 o 17:49 Darren Indyke c pisze: 

Adam, 

LSJE, LLC is unable to accept your last proposal. Without going into any further detail over the parties' 
respective rights and responsibilities in this matter, LSJE, LLC proposes to pay for all of the shipping 
costs if Sportis will equip the boat with two engines (at Sportis's own cost) and ship the boat with the 
engines and the trailer back to LSJE, LLC in St. Thomas. Please advise if this proposal is acceptable. 
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Very truly yours, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, New York 10022 

Telephone: (212) 971-1314 

Telecopier: (646) 350-0378 

Mobile: (862) 485-6315 

email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 

privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 

or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 

communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2015 Darren K. 

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Jul 10, 2015, at 2:56 PM, Adam Zygowski > wrote: 
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Enclosed please find our letter. 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

W dniu .07.2015 o 13:49 Darren Indyke < 

Please see my letter attached. 

Very truly yours, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, New York 10022 

Telephone: (212) 971-1314 

Telecopier: (646) 350-0378 

Mobile: (862) 485-6315 

email: 

pisze: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
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privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 

or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 

communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2015 Darren K. 

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Jun 30, 2015, at 6:21 AM, Adam Zygowski < 

Enclosed please find our letter. 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

W dniu .06.2015 o 21:13 Darren Indyke c > pisze: 

Please see attached my letter in response. 

Very truly yours, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 

> wrote: 
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DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, New York 10022 

Telephone: (212) 971-1314 

Telecopier: (646) 350-0378 

Mobile: (862) 485-6315 

email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 

privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 

or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 

communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - C 2015 Darren K. 

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

****************************** ************************************************* 

On Jun 16, 2015, at 10:21 AM, Adam Zygowski < wrote: 

Please see the attached letter in reply. 

Sorry for delay. 
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Adam Zygowski 

W dniu .05.2015 o 00:56 Darren Indyke 

Please see the attached letter. 

Very truly yours, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, New York 10022 

Telephone: (212) 971-1314 

Telecopier: 046) 350-0378 

Mobile: O62) 485-6315 

email: 

> pine: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 

privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 

or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 

communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
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Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - Ø 2015 Darren K. 

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

************* ****** 

SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91 

mob. + 48 697 250 500 

fax: +48 58 676 00 92 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk P61noc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 
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Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdafisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91 

mob. + 48 697 250 500 

fax: +48 58 676 00 92 

.pd f>5 Pdf> 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk P61noc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdafisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 
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Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91 

mob. + 48 697 250 500 

fax: +48 58 676 00 92 
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Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk P6Inoc Oddzial w Gdafisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdafisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91 

mob. + 48 697 250 500 

fax: +48 58 676 00 92 

Rejestracja: Sąd Rejonowy Gdańsk Północ Oddział w Gdańsku, 

VIII Wydział Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapitał zakładowy: 2.058.170 PLN w całości opłacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-1840-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdańsk-Połnoc in Gdańsk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 
84-207 Koleczkowo 
ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 
tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91 
mob. + 48 697 250 500 
fax: +48 58 676 00 92 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk P6hioc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 
VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calo§ci oplacony. 
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdafisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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