
From: weffre E." <*eevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: Leighton 
Date: Thu, 16 Jul 2015 19:13:58 +0000 

Yes 

On Thu, Jul 16, 2015 at 3:12 PM > wrote: 
i spoke with russell and leighton 
russell said he would pay out of his fee the 3,250 of moving costs 
russell's fee would be paid at 3,000 per month over 8 months for total cost of 24,000 vs 
i thought this structure gave us protection in case leighton did not work out 

leighton is ok with all terms and will confirm later today or tomorrow that he can come 
go to PBI with you on 7/29 
the original apt we showed leighton and his wife was 108 which said paul barret 
currently using 
apt 11B is currently vacant and i asked sue to take photos to show to leighton 
leighton also asked if he could begin moving his stuff into 11B next week 

please advise if you are ok with above 
thank you 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

ew or c, 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Jul 16, 2015, at 11:53 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

35,000 (175k x 20%) 

to LSJ 7/28 and then 

family member is 

allenby, we split moving costs. i would like if possible for him to be here 28th and fly with my 29th to pb . 
i will not be back on island before sept otherwise 

please note 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 

EFTA00851051



return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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