From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Vera Savcic _
Ce: Adam Bly <[ | | | -
Subject: Re: JEE loan
Date: Wed, 01 Jul 2015 13:07:00 +0000

thank you and enjoy the wedding
next Tuesday July 7th is ok to review final payment amount details

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Jul 1, 2015, at 9:05 AM, Vera Savcic *‘»’_ wrote:

Richard - we will be paying off the loan next week.

I am away this week for my stepdaughter’s wedding and would be appreciative if vou allowed me this time to
enjoy this event.

I will be back in New York on Tuesday July 7 and will contact yvou for payment details.

Kindly confirm this will be okay.

Vera

On Jun 30, 2015, at 12:33 PM, Richard Kahn *—'-* wrote:

Congrats on deal with Spotify
Please advise when loan will be paid in full

Thank you

Rich

On 6/2/15, 11:30 AM, "Vera Savcic" *_'-'-* wrote:
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