From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Rothschild Auction
Date: Fri, 26 Jun 2015 19:29:50 +0000

Attachments: DB JEE WT Piasa B6895.60E 041615 backup.pdf;
Auction_Antique purchase by Rothschild paid and unpaid invoices 061915 copy for J
EE.pdf

attached items in june 25th email below are with shipper and ready to be sent to L8]
shall we ship those 5 items or wait until you decide on other auction items per june 19th email
please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

From: bellaklein <|HEEEG_— -

Subject: Paid Auction items ready for shipment
Date: June 25, 2015 at 9:55:14 AM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </ -

Attached paid items purchased from Galerie Tamenaga and Piasa ready to be shipped. Items from Piasa
currently are at the shipper Art Transit in Panis.

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn </ -

Subject: Rothschild Auction
Date: June 19, 2015 at 4:30:31 PM EDT
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Please advise on items you would like us to purchase
Thanks

EFTA00853328



Richard Kahn
HBEREK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: bellaklein <

Subject: Auction
Date: June 19, 2015 at 2:38:44 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn </ -

Attached 15 auction purchases by Mrs Rothschild for JE approval. Please confirm if JE would like some of the
armchairs and sofas to be upholster in Paris .

Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

EFTA00853329



