
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: ann rodriquez < 

Subject: Re: LSJ: Dump truck accident 
Date: Thu, 28 May 2015 02:23:58 +0000 

Yes 

On Wednesday, May 27, 2015, ann rodriquez < > wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

Just confirming, You would like us to issue a check in the amount of $375.00 to Mr. Gonzalez and in return we 
would ask him to sign a release form, relieving us from any other obligations after the said amount has been 
issued. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Tuesday, May 19, 2015 5:47 PM, Ann Rodriquez > wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

On March 19th, Tap went to pick up gravel from Heavy Material and on his way back a rusted area 
on the Dump Truck gave way and gravel began spewing everywhere. 

Mr. Juan Gonzales is claiming on March 19th 2015 the gravel that fell from our dump truck hit his 
windshield and broke it, He said that he wrote down the license plate number and went to file a 
police report. 

Attached is a copy of the Police report and 3 quotes to repair the Windshield. 

Quote from Mr. Gonzales: 
Budget: $856.54 

Quotes I found today with Mr. Gonzales: 
Almin Glass: $447.00 
Merwin Auto Glass: $375.00 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace allin 
Date: May 19, 2015 at 12:29:21 PM AST 
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To: Darren Indyke  fr", ann rodriquez 
Subject: Privileged and Confidential - Windshield - May 19, 2015 

Greetings Darren, 

As promised, DW 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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