
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Fwd: 
Date: Wed, 27 May 2015 17:02:07 +0000 

didnot we send him more than 1000 
 Forwarded messa  e   
From: Joseph Thakuria  
Date: Wed, May 27, 2015 at 1:00 PM 
Subject: Re: 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Darren Indyke <4 

Jeffrey, I'm still going through thousands of individual variants (in your data and others). 

I'm hesitant to promise it will be completed by Monday, June 1st, but if you want to set up a call then (or later 
next week when convenient for you), I can discuss what I've already reviewed and send you any summary info. 
(It may be completed by Monday but I can't promise. I'm only 1 person reviewing this data.) 

Normally, I would prefer not to send people their raw data without completing analysis but, given the life science 
resources you have, I can also forward that along to you on Monday. 

The alternative to withdraw has/is always available to you (with full refund). 

Let me know how you'd like to proceed. RE: my supervisors, I'm on faculty at mgh and hms as you know, but 
this work is being done independently by me. 

Again, I just want to stress this is all voluntary so just let me know how you'd like to proceed. With respect to the 
refund, the $1000 was only collected to pay (at a discounted price) for the sequencing. But I'm happy to refund 
it. (Even though your sample was sequenced - I will absorb the cost.) 

Thanks, 
Joe 

On Wed, May 27, 2015 at 8:50 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
I assume i will now have to write to your supervisors and request that you return all money sent to you to 
date.. 
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