
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski 

Subject: Re: Delivery Invoice for N908JE 
Date: Tue, 26 May 2015 23:41:21 +0000 

Yes 

On Tuesday, May 26, 2015, Larry Visoski a wrote: 
Jeffrey 
May I have your approval for B727 stambagh invoice for Two tires, accomplish Flap AD,. Battery 
certification., 
See attached invoice 

Thank you 
Larry 

$37,910 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "JR Stambaugh" < > 
Date: May 4, 2015 at 12:13:0 
To: "Lvjet" a < 
Subject: Re: Delivery Invoice for N908JE 
Reply-To: "JR Stambaugh"

Larry, 

The 02 system was checked, all the masks and lines. The troubleshooting identified a sleeve on a supply line 
that was leaking. The sleeve was replaced and the system re-serviced. this was accomplished on the 15th. 
Prior to departing on the 28th, the system was serviced for departure. It was not leaking prior to your 
departure, but I have gone ahead and removed the troubleshooting and repair time. 

JR Stambaugh 
Accountable Manager 
Stambau h Aviation 

From: Lvjet 
Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2015 1:36 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Delivery Invoice for N908.18 

Hello JR,. 
I received your invoice,. 
we arrived with an O2 leak, two weeks ago at 8OK,.. I was charged $742 dollars for the repair, when I departed 8OK, I 
had 1800 psi in the bottle,. today I have 500psi,. how can you say this leak is repaired and signed off,. and I still have a 
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LARGE leak? now I'm in PBI with the same problem. 
it would be easy for your guys to leak check this repair, 
please reissue a new invoice with a larger credit for my troubles please,. maybe remove the $750 Office surcharge and 
O2 leak item,. 
please $1,000 ea for Battery top charge seams high as well, 
please review, let me know your thoughts? 

thank you, 
Larry Visoski 
Jege Inc. 

—Original Message--
From: JR Stambaugh
To: Larry Visoski < 
Sent: Wed, Apr 29, 2015 10:35 am 
Subject Delivery Invoice for N908JE 

Larry, 
Please find attached the delivery invoice for N908JE from this current visit... 
Thanks, and have a pleasant day... 
JR Stambaugh 
Accountable Manager 
Stambaugh Aviation 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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