From: Richard Kahn <||| | [ | | -
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationiagmail com=
Subject: Denali removal of bucket seats and replace with bench
Date: Sat, 23 May 2015 16:55:56 +0000

Attached 1s from dealer we purchased car from. [ also called another dealer yesterday that said the same thing. | plan to bring car
to Michael Angelo on Tuesday to ask them as well in addition to oblaining quotes for stereo and hights.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Ron Shan{™ <

Date: May 23, 2015 at 12:23:03 PM EDT
To: _

Subject: Re: follow up

It usually takes 6-8 weeks. No yvou can not put seats, it is not designed for it. Has to be done in assembly line.

-----Original Message-----

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard Kahn" ]
Sent: 5232015 11:21:00 AM

To: "Ron Shari™

Subject: Re: follow up

How long would that take. Can we order seat and put in car we have? Thank you.

Sent from my iPhone

On May 23, 2015, at 9:56 AM, Ron Sharif <|||| | R o<

Good morning!

l am glad your boss likes the Denali. Yes you can have bench in the middle. Denali's do come standard with captains chairs.
S0, | would have to build you one with bench in the middle. Let me know. Thank you!

-Fon

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard kKahn ]
Sent:  5/23/2015 2:51:00 AM
To: "Ron Sharif™

Subject: Re: follow up

Received car Thursday and boss loves it If we wanted 1o obtain a standard row vs existing bucket seats in 2nd row is tt
possible. Please advise. Thank you.

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022
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Tel 212-971-1306
Fax 646-350-0954
Cell 917-414-7584

On May 22, 2015, at 1:48 PM, Ron Sharif <|| G - o

There 15 no password for the car, Your onstar password 15 123456

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard Kahn" |
Sent:  5/22/2015 12:12:00 PM

To: "Ron Sharif”

Subject: Re: follow up

Do you know password for car? Thanks

Sent from my iPhone

On May 7, 2015, at 1:53 PM, Ron Sharif <[ | | |- o

You are very welcome! If there is anything [ can do to help please let me know. 1 strive to get completely satis
survey from all of my customers. I know out of state buyer do sometimes go through a little more hassle. Again,
apologize on behall of our team for the wire transfer issue.

My goal is to make sure this transaction goes as smooth as we planned. If or when you get the survey from G
Motors please make sure you are completely satisfied if not let me know what 1 can do to make sure you are con
satislied. Thank you again for your business,

[ will look forward to hear from you about your driver and pick up time.

With regards,
Ron

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard Kahn" |
Sent:  5/7/2015 12:37:00 PM

To: "Ron Sharif”

Subject: Re: follow up

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell 917-414-7584

On May 7, 2015, at 12:56 PM, Ron Sharif <||| | | G- o
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Yes we have received the documents. Finance is reviewing the paperwork. | have not got a call from your
-Ron

-----Original Message-----

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard Kahn" ]

Sent: 5772015 10:49:00 AM

To: "Ron Sharil™

Subject:

did you receive fed ex? has driver contacted you? thanks Richard Kahn HBREK Associates Ine. 575 L

Avenue 4th Floor New York, NY 10022 te] 212-971-1306 fax 646-350-0954 cell 917-414-7584
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