
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationggmail.eoin> 

To: Lvjet < •>

Subject: Re: HAPP 3RD YR Billing JEGE 440052921 GIV 1085 N423TT : CASE-10472966 [ 
re L00D30dWxY._50013nadf6:ref 

Date: Wed, 20 May 2015 21:50:17 +0000 

Yes 

On Wednesday, May 20, 2015, Lvjet < > wrote: 
Jeffrey 
may I have your approval for the HAPP "Honeywell Avionic Protection Program",. annual price is $32,300.00 
I've utilized this program to our savings in the past two years,. just last month we changed a DU885 panel which would have 
cost us $85,000 alone,. 

thank you 
Larry 

 Original Message-----
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Larry Visoski < 
Sent: Wed, May 20. 2015 5:02 pm 
Subject: Fwd: HAPP 3RD YR Billing JEGE 440052921 GIV 1085 N423TT : CASE-10472966 [ 
refL00D30dWxY._50013nadf6:ref 

darren wants you to obtain jee approval before we send wire.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry <IMI I> 
Subject: Fwd: HAPP 3RD YR Billing JEGE 440052921 GIV 1085 N423TT : CASE-10472966 [ 
ref:_00D30dWxY._50013nadf6:ref ] 
Date: May 20, 2015 at 4:47:45 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn < >, Bella Klein < 

Jege LLC 
Approved,. 
Maintenance service plan for GIV,. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPad 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: happ-sales < 
Date: March 16, 2015 at 6:20:40 PM EDT 
To: Larry Visoski < 
Subject: HAPP 3RD YR Billing JEGE 440052921 GIV 1085 N423TT : CASE-10472966 [ 
ref:_00D3OdWxY._50013nadf6:ref ] 

Dear Larry, 

***Thank you for doing business with us, your case tracking number for this renewal request is provided above. If you wish to 
communicate with us further about this renewal, you may reply to this e-mail -- please leave the Reference Case # within the 
subject line for quicker responses.*** 

It is now time for your warranty annual billing. Please find attached contract details for your HAPP Contract 
440052921 (Exhibit 1 attached). 

At your earliest convenience please send the PO on which you will cover the third year cost or let me know if we can 
put the aircraft serial number as PO number. Please note that we are sending this notification several weeks in 
advance to allow you plenty of notice. Please note that if we do not receive your confirmation on this request before 
05.13.2015 your service could be interrupted. 

"Upon receipt of a purchase order or confirmation to bill with the aircraft serial number will prompt the invoice 
generation for your annual agreement," 

**NEW** Honeywell is pleased to introduce HAPP GOLD 
HAPP GOLD is a new Premium Service designed to help reduce many of the additional charges often 
related to a necessary Avionics repair. HAPP GOLD can be added to your current HAPP agreement for the 
nominal fee of $30 USD per flight hour (based on contracted hours). HAPP GOLD will allow you to enjoy the 
following benefits: 

• 24/7 Road Crew Service for AOGs worldwide 

• Extended troubleshooting 

• Counter to counter shipments and Saturday delivery 

• Additional fees resulting from "No Fault Founds" 

• Tech Publications- Pilot Guides, System Description and Operation Manuals (SDOM's) 

We have attached a brochure for more information on HAPP GOLD. If you would like to enroll in HAPP 
GOLD or have any further questions please reply back to . If you do not 
wish to enroll in HAPP GOLD at this time please just confrm your billing information for your Standard Annual 
HAPP coverage. 

Regards, 

Dulce Ilusion Del Olmo 
HAPP Representative II Cust Supp 
Honeywell Aerospace 

760 339 5727 
(686)842 5727 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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