
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Final Invoice 

Date: Mon, 18 May 2015 17:46:10 +0000 

this is not the disputed amount:? 

On Mon, May 18, 2015 at 1:41 PM, Richard Kahn < 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn
Date: March 18, 2015 at 10:05:18 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski 
Date: September 24, 2014 at 10:57:58 AM MDT 
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 

One more email to follow 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eric Roth
Date: September 22, 2014 at 3:11:45 PM EDT 
To: Lvjet 
Subject: RE: Final Invoice 

Attached are the invoices. 

wrote: 
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ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

C www.intljet.com 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Lvjet 
Sent: Monday, September 22, 2014 2:53 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Final Invoice 

mailto 

did you say you have original invoice to attach also? I think the more backup you provide. it will be easier to 
decipher the final invoice 

-----Original Messa 
From: Eric Roth 
To: LVJET 
Cc: Eileen Craig 
Sent: Mon, Sep 22, 2014 1:30 pm 
Subject: Final Invoice 

Larry, 

As discussed over the last couple of months, attached is our final invoice that includes all of the work we have completed on 
the Gulfstream. 

Aside from not charging JE for many of the smaller "requests", I have provided a significant discount for the entertainment 
system, just trying to reach towards a break-even at best. 

I am a small company, so your prompt remittance will certainly help my cash flow position. 
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Please call me should you have any questions, but trust me when I say that I was more than fair and generous. 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

www.intliet.com 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport. Ronkonkoma, Ncw York 11779 

E 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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