
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski <Ila> 

Subject: Re: Permagard. 
Date: Thu, 15 Mar 2018 14:33:30 +0000 
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Ok 

On Tokhu, Mar 15, 2018 at 10:22 AM Larry Visoski c  wrote: 
Jeffrey, I spoke directly to Permaguard in Miami, they offered us a 10% discount and application takes 3 days, 
since they are based in Miami Permagard reps will be on site to supervise the application, if you go to Palm 
Beach tomorrow they can start on Saturday and be completed by Monday afternoon 

Price $20,300 

Do you approve? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Fernando Guerrero < 
Date: March 15, 2018 at 10:16:57 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Permagard. 

Hi Larry, 

It was a pleasure speaking with you this morning. Our list price for the G550 is $23,000. Fontainebleau 
Aviation which will be the certified applicator on this project can offer a 10% discount for the new paint. 
The total on the aircraft will be $20,700. If agreed we can fit the a/c this Saturday, Sunday and Monday. We 
will also be on site to help support. 

Thank you, 
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Fernando Guerrero 

Operations Manager 
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The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of this information 
by persons or entities other than the intended recipient(s) is unauthorized and prohibited. Any transmission of 
confidential and/or privileged material to persons or entities other than the intended recipient(s) shall not be 
construed as a waiver of any privilege or confidence. If you receive this transmission in error, please contact the 
sender and delete the material. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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