
From: Ann Rodriquez
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Summer Camp: Emery & Sierra Poleon 
Date: Fri, 15 May 2015 00:04:55 +0000 

Attachments: packinglist.pdf; Parent_Handbook_2015.pdf; Wire_Transfer_Informaton.doc; 
Emery_Poleon_SS2-SS3_2015.pdf; Sierra_Poleon_SS2-SS3_2015.pdf 

Hey Bossman, 

The girls will be leaving for summer camp "Circle F" on June 21st - August 1st. Do I have your permission to 
forward the balance to Rich to pay by Wire? 

Located: 
Lake Wales, Florida 
Fly into: 
Orlando International Airport and Drive 55min to Circle F Camp ground. 
Amount: 
$5,505.00 each (Total: $11,010.00) 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kris Canchon"
Date: May 13, 2015 at 7:10:13 PM AS I 
To:
Subject: SS2-SS3 Invoices & Information 

Hello Mrs. Rodriquez, 

Thank you for your registration of Sierra & Emery, we look forward to them attending this summer. I have attached the 
wire transfer information for final payment, please advise me via email when you have done it so we can be on the 
lookout for it. I have attached a recommended packing list so you can get a head start on the things that they will need 
when they arrive on June 21st. Below I have listed some instructions to complete the paperwork they will need before 
they arrive, if you have any questions please give the office a call at and speak with Melissa, if she is not 
available please give me a call so I can assist you. 

You will go to to complete their 2015 
Required Forms, once you submit those it will give you the option on the next screen to print out their Physical and 
Standing order that go to the doctor ( make sure the doctor circles yes or no on medications that are okay to give at 
camp on the Standing Order and make sure they stamp both pages). You will send those back to me via email or fax 
with a copy of their shot record and Insurance information, we will need these approximately 1 weeks before they 
arrive. The only thing left after that would be to complete their 2015 Activity Selector which you can find in the same 
area below the 2015 required forms. 
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Kris Canchon 
Assistant Director 
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