
From: Alireza Ittihadieh < 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: Re: AvJet BBJ -YG062 
Date: Thu, 14 May 2015 13:43:55 +0000 

$29.5 

From: Jeffrey E. [mallto:Jeeyacation@gmall.com] 
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2015 2:33 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: Re: Aylet BB) -YG062 

what was the price? 

On Thu, May 14, 2015 at 9:23 AM, Alireza Ittihadieh < > wrote: 
Hope this note finds you well. 

We now have a signed LOI an non-refundable deposit 

I am afraid LB has lost this one. 

As Ever 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeea@gmail.com 
Sent: Sunday, April 26, 2015 6:00 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: 

ill ask 

On Sun, Apr 26, 2015 at 12:41 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh < 
No problem...what time 
BR 

Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 
Tel: I Fax: 

wrote: 

From: jeffrey E. <jeelai0i@gmail.com>
Date: Sun, 26 Apr 2015 11:00:25 -0400 
To: Alireza Ittihadiehcl 
Subject: 

feeling betteer. can you organize for leon to see avjet bbj on tues in burbank? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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