From: Richard Kahn < -

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: FW: Denali
Date: Wed, 29 Apr 2015 22:45:23 +0000

Today | called NJ dealer today to negotiate and they were very difficult
After 30 mins of back and forth they only offered a 500 discount because | previously purchased a car from that dealer

They upset me so | searched for black with cocoa shale in major states and cities FL Chicago LA Texas and found four other cars
with same specs

Best deal was in Texas (will send details in next 2 emails)

Mote this car has standard 20" wheels vs 22" chrome wheels in NJ

They took 4473 off MSRP however we will incur shipping costs of approx 1473
| can have car in NY by middle to end of next week
MJ car can be in NY Friday or Monday

Please advise on purchasing car in NJ (500 off MSRP) or Texas (3000 net after shipping)

From: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 at 7:02 PM

To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: Denali

its ok just buy it

On Tue, Apr 28, 2015 at 6:56 PM, Richard Kahn <[ - ot

When | search 10021 zip code 22 cars come up and only 1 has cocoa shale interior with 22" wheels
| will search inventory around country tomorrow to see if | can obtain same specs below with 20" wheels

http:/fwww. gme.com/tools/2015-btl-vehicle-pages/2015-yukon-xl-denali-locate-a-vehicle.extapp.html?tp_gmna-
btl=/locateNewVehicle/Init US#

2015 YUKON DEMNALI (4WD) $78,130*

AVAILABLE AT:
EMGLEWOOD AUTO
GROUP, L.L.C.

386 GRAND AVE
ENGLEWOOD, NJ 07831-4101
Telephone: (201) 87 1-0606
Fax: (201) 227-1301

Distance: 9.13 MILES

Map & Directions

REQUEST ATEST DRIVE
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REQUEST A QUOTE

TRADE IN APPRAISAL

VEHICLE DETAILS

VIM: 1GKS2JKJTFREZGEET

MSRP Standard Vehicle Price

INSTALLED OPTIONS TOTAL
GVW RATING 7, 500 LBS
Onyx Black

Cocoa'Shale, Perforated Leather-appointed Seat
Trim

Open road Package
Premium Package

22° aluminum wheels, premium paint with chrome
inserts

Rear cargo mat

Integrated Roof Rails

Option Package Discount
Destination Freight Charge
TOTAL MSRP

PRICE*"

$70,220.00
$6,715.00
NO CHARGE
$0.00

$0.00

$2,860.00
$3,165.00
£895.00

$85.00
$210.00
($500.00)
$1,195.00
$78,130.00

§re 130
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From: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Date: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 at 6:47 PM

To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: Mercedes Benz-Maybach

also for the denali i woudl prefer the standard 20 inch wheels not the 22

On Tue, Apr 28, 2015 at 5:31 PM, Richard Kahn <} - o=

options we can purchase only at time of purchase are attached

two most common per dealer for NYC customers are:
1) dent removal {up to 4") all around car - 560.00
2) tire and wheel plus (pays for replacement tires and rims for damages) - 4,160.00

please advise if you would like any options
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Aszsociates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell 917-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:

From:

To:

Subject: Mercedes Benz-Maybach
Date: April 28, 2015 at 5:25:10 PM EDT

Richard,

Please see attached, | will call you back to discuss.
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Theresa Ingannamorte

Finance Manager
Mercedes-Benz Manhattan

T70 11th Ave. (btwn 53rd & 54th)
Mew York, NY 10019
I )

I )
I

If vou are not the addressee, please inform us immediately that you have received this e-mail by mistake, and delete it.
We thank you for your support

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
canstitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@pgmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please naote
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside infarmation, and is intended anly for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
IEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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