
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Boris Nikolic

Subject: Fwd: Biosys Balances 
Date: Tue, 14 Apr 2015 18:45:12 +0000 

 Forwarded message 
From: Peter L. Corsell < 
Date: Tue, Apr 14, 2015 at 2:44 PM 
Subject: Biosys Balances 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com>

Hi Jeffrey, 

The cash balances in the Biosys accounts at SunTrust are as follows: 

Biosys Capital Management, LLC has $103,485.22 

Biosys Capital Partners, LP has $49,652.35 

Just fyi, these balances do not take into account travel expenses or the cost of the Biosys URL. 

Also, I assume that Boris would want sole ownership of the name and the URL in a settlement scenario. 

All the best, 

Peter 
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