From: Ann Rodriquez < -

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=

subject: Fva:

Date: Fri, 10 Apr 2015 16:01:38 +0000

Hey Bossman,
Mr. Srnka asked me if | would like to do 1 full payment or 2 installments?

Please advise,
Ann R,

Begin forwarded message:

From: Erik Srnka <Erik. Srnka(meritas net>
Date: April 10, 2015 at 11:37:34 AM AST

To: Ann Rodriguez < -
Subject: RE:

Great, which option do you prefer, one payment or two payment?

Thanks,

Erik Srmka

Grlobal Admission and Sales Director

Important:

This electronic mail message and any attached files contain information intended for the exclusive use of the
individual or entity to whom it 1s addressed and may contain information that is proprietary, privileged,
confidential and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If vou are not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any viewing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this information may be subject to legal
restriction or sanction, Please notify the sender, by electronic mail or telephone, of any unintended recipients
and delete the original message without making any copies.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ann Rodriquez [mailto [

Sent: Friday, April 10, 2015 10:37 AM
To: Erik Srnka

Subject: Re

Ok! Great. I'm all for it

I just want to make sure that they are happy and comfortable at all times. So Whatever needs to be done will be
done.

EFTA00860034



Thank vou,
Ann R

On Apr 10, 2015, at 11:22 AM, Erik Smka _u.-'mlr::

Hello Ann,

We only have two payment options; one pay May 1st, and two pay ($750) finance fee May 1st, Oct 1st.
Monthly payments are not on option.

Visitation is fine and 1s better on the weekends, we recommend they get setteled first.

-wmlld be on campus for the dm'm':s*-wuuld likely be at the Coral Springs campus - so there

schedules might not match so they may not see each other every day.

We have an ACH debit form for ancillary school charges. Not sure il'-wuuld gqualify for a debit/credit
card.

We issue school laptops and cell phones as part of the fees, they are also welcome to bring their own.
Let me know if you have any other questions.

Erik Srnka

(rlobal Admission and Sales Director

Important:

This electronic mail message and any attached files contain information intended for the exclusive use of the
individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information that is proprietary, privileged,
confidential and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
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hereby notified that any viewing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this information may be subject to
legal restriction or sanction. Please notify the sender, by electronic mail or telephone, of any unintended
recipients and delete the original message without making any copies.

From: Ann Rodriquez [mailto: |

Sent: Friday, April 10, 2015 10:15 AM

To: Erik Srnka

Subject: Re: Emery & Sierra Poleon

Hi Mr. Srnka,

Gireat 1) Just a few...

How convenient would it be for them if I paid in full?

What are the setbacks in paying monthly?

How often can I come visit them?

Will they be able to see each other everyday?

Are they allowed to have a credit/debit cards?

Do they need l-pads?

They each have MacBooks and iPhones.

Thank you,

EFTA00860036



Ann R,

On Apr 10, 2015, at 10:18 AM, Erik Smka <Erk.Srnkaf@meritas. net> wrote:

Hello Ann,

After reviewing their files, we would be willing to offer them both admission. Do you have any questions
abou the program, tuition pricing, or boarding before 1 process their enrollment contracts?

Sincerely,

Erik Srmka

(rlobal Admission and Sales Director

Important:

This electronic mail message and any attached files contain information intended for the exclusive use of the
individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information that is proprietary, privileged,
confidential and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any viewing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this information may be subject
to legal restriction or sanction. Please notify the sender, by electronic mail or telephone, of any unintended
recipients and delete the original message without making any copies.

From: Ann Rodriquez [M]
Sent: Thursday, April 09, 2015 4:49 PM

To: Erik Srnka

suvict: I

EFTAO00860037



Hi Mr. Srnka,

I haven't heard anything since the girls interview with yvou last week.

I'm just checking on the status to see if all i1s well with admission?

Ann Rodriquez
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