From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn *—-“-*
Subject: Re: Artefacto
Date: Thu, 09 Apr 2015 19:03:56 +0000

leighton allenby tomorw interview at 12

On Thu, Apr 9, 2015 at 2:50 PM, Richard Kahn f_ wrote:

[ believe 1 was finally able to finalize terms with Artefacto

Balance due for furniture - per original terms - RK 7337534
Balance due for furniture - per Artefacto 102.317.82
Difference = Additional Shipping charges 28,042 4%

I was able to negotiate 28,942 48 to 8.624.66 s0 we would send Artefacto 82,000 as a final payment

There should be an additional shipping charge as we ordered more items than original order however 1 felt that
amount should be in 5000-7500 range

not the 28,942 48 they proposed.

Artefacto would have items picked up from their warehouse in FL on Monday April 13th and delivered in NY
somewhere between April 22-24

Please advise if ok to proceed
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Eduardo”

To: "Richard Kahn" <
P, "Gregory Riches”

Cc:
>, "Rodrigo Stegani™
> "Susana Pereira” <N "\ izna
Doval™ >

Subject: RE: SLK PENDING BALANCE / SHIPPING
Date: April 8, 2015 at 3:32:12 PM EDT

Richard,

EFTAO00860066



If we receive payment within this week, we can schedule the pickup for Monday, and have all
furniture scheduled for delivery to the apartments 229 23th and the 24", that been said, there are

other variants beyond our control, such as weather, or with the 3rd part delivery in NY, building
requirements or any other unforeseen circumstances in NY.

Please understand, | do want to finish the delivery on schedule as much as you do.

Thank you,

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: I

Sent: Wednesday, April 08, 2015 3:07 PM
To: Eduardo

cc: . | :ilic; Gregory Riches; |G, Rodrigo Stegani; Susana Pereira;
Mariana Doval
Subject: Re: SLK PENDING BALAMNCE [/ SHIPPING

vou still have not answered my question 1 asked vesterday which is when will items arrive in NY

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

tel
fa

ce

On Apr 8, 2015, at 3:00 PM, Eduardo ‘i—?* wrote:

Richard,

All items are ready for pick up, the order can leave on Tuesday.
We need the payment by tomorrow in order to set everything up, since the schedule needs to be
confirmed ASAP with the freight company.

Thank you

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: |

Sent: Wednesday, April 08, 2015 12:47 FM
To: Eduardo
Cc: Gregory Riches; [N

Subject: Re: 5LK PENDING BALANCE [/ SHIPPING

please respond on NY delivery dates so we can do wire
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBEE Associates Inc.

tel
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fax
cell

On Apr 7, 2015, at 4:39 PM, Eduardo < - otc:

| am checking with the shipper to see when can they pick up the cargo.

In our warehouse all orders to NY are ready.

From: Richard Kahn [maitto: |

Sent: Tuesday, April 07, 2015 4:28 PM

To: Eduardo

Cc: Gregory Riches;

Subject: Re: SLK PENDING BALANCE [ SHIPPING

thanks for quick reply

ready means to be loaded on truck

how many days until delivery in NY thereafter?
thank you

Richard Kahn

te! [N

fax
cell

On Apr 7, 2015, at 4:16 PM, Eduardo fi_-? wrote:

From the moment we receive the final payment, accounting will release the delivery, | believe

the whole order can be ready for Monday.

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: |

Sent: Tuesday, April 07, 2015 4:12 PM
To: Eduardo

Cc: Gregory Riches; I

Subject: Re: 5LK PENDING BALANCE [/ SHIPPING

thank you for email
when will items be shipped and arrive in NY?
please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

EFTA00860068



please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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