From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
o I -

Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 24 Mar 2015 15:57:46 +0000

fund 14 k

On Tue, Mar 24, 2015 at 11:10 AM, bellaklein *’_'-? wrote:

Jeffrey,

Attached please find - expense report for items purchased for LSJ and 9 East. Total amount 15 $928.40.
Please advise if i can reimburse [JJJlj as she has $20 left in her bank account. Last time we funded her

account in the amount of $10,000 on 12/17/2014,

Tel:

please note
The information contained in this communication s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use. disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved

EFTA00861532



