From: "jeffrev E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
o I —

Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 18 Mar 2015 15:18:15 +0000

wire will be received when?

On Wed, Mar 18, 2015 at 9:07 AM, bellaklein <|| GG -  otc:

[taly has a himit of 999 Euros per person in 7 days period. Please advise if 1 should proceed with wire transfer

to Johanna in the amount of 3100 Euros.

Thank you,
Bella

On Mar 18, 2015, at 10:40 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail. com> wrote:

ﬂﬁk-if amex would transfer in cash the 3k euro
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