
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Brad Wechsler 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2015 18:53:53 +0000 

Yes 

On Tue, Feb 24, 2015 at 2:51 PM, Brad Wechsler < > wrote: 
Yes; just to confirm: a personal check grossed up and we tell melanie she shld report. Correct? 
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gntn> 
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2015 13:27:27 -0400 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: 

please make sure tha leon pays melanie her money, so that we don't run afoul of personal corp split 
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