
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sun, 22 Feb 2015 16:09:05 +0000 

hying to figure out the issue with the dissolution of all three,/ 

On Sun, Feb 22, 2015 at 11:30 AM, Eileen Alexanderson < wrote: 
$3.25 mil of note was paid off by the LDB2011 LLC. That cash went to Ben's 2010 Trust. Part went toward 
townhouse purchase and $1.2 mil cash is still held between the 2010 Trust and Donalbane LLC. $5.2mi1 of 
note was purchased by the LDB 2011 LLC ( which is now owned by APO 1) 

On Feb 21, 2015, at 4:57 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

the phantom income generating note to ben, did we get rid of it entirely? 
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