
From: David Mitchell

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Sunday 2/11. Again howie is traveling so I wanted to give everyone... 

Date: Mon, 12 Mar 2018 00:37:15 +0000 

FYI 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 
1212-486-4444 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Amengual, Randolph"
Date: March 11, 2018 at 8:19:41 PM EDT 
To: Mitchell David
Subject: Fwd: Sunday 2/11. Again howie is traveling so t wanted to give everyone... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Stephen Hanson < > 
Date: March 11, 2018 at 6:56:46 PM EDT 
To: "Randolph. / David Life La er 17 / Amengual" < IMIMar g ilOWIE / SUE 
MUCHNICK , Mirium / howie muchnick 
Cc: Shanson900 
Subject: Sunday 2/11. Again howie is traveling so I wanted to give everyone... 

Sunday 2/11. Again howie is traveling so I wanted to give everyone a heads up 

Regarding money due Henry and loan documents 
I can not acquire the loan with the terms you have given 
RUSSELL has told me from the start and advised me - if he is not the first behind the Commericial lenders 
also listing his original 98k loan - there is no loan 
If david can acquire a loan under these conditions- I suggest you take it 

As far as the 28k still due the restaurant from the original money the restaurant lent the hotel - First I 
appreciate the 20k sent Friday 
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I have not asked Russel if he would except - as you offered - having the hotel pay the remaining 28 k on April 
9 — but before I try to extend this payment to April 9; let's see if we are going to agree on the terms of the 
needed $100 k loan note - 
Fyi Russels wife is very sick and I can't put or do not want to add any additional pressure on him 
For me. The 50k loan doesn't really help - I am not sure if I need all 200k as originally requested - but with 
out at least 100k the $50 k loan is useless 
As sown in documents sent last week - at prime costs we are almost at break even -but the weather - one of 
the largest factors -3 storms. In 2 weeks makes it almost impossible to achieve our needed goals - and the 
cold weather still continues 

The 100k - depending on the weather should get us into some part of April - where- as long as the weather 
turns for the better we should start to break even 
As it stands now we are losing 10-15k per week - which we should be able to meet- or succeed -with a little 
weather and review luck 
We are also waiting for additional reviews - we know Adam platt has been in - as he has posted regarding 
But 
The restaurant will be 30k overdrawn by Thursday this is even after receiving the 20k 

I have reviewed with SR Mgmt - and the plan is - so we give you heads up -
But if we can not finish all documents on Monday 

At the end of service on Wednesday - we will close the restaurant 

Some staff will stay on board to remove garbage and clean the space- at some time after- I will surrender the 
lease 
Only SR Mgmt of Henry is aware so please do not say anything to any other HENRY staff and advise your 
hotel staff of same - I need these employees to finish Wednesday service 
I really do not understand how david has put millions upon millions of above budgeted debt on the hotel -
before any investors are paid back — yet you do not want to 
1- repay in full a loan that was given to the hotel from the restaurant —balance due 28k 
2- at least an additional $ 100 thousand dollars in debt to the hotel —to try to keep the restaurant open till the 
warm weather hits - 

Sent from my iPad 

This e-mail and any attached file is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
information that is privileged, confidential or otherwise protected from disclosure. Dissemination, distribution or copying of 
this e-mail or the information herein by anyone other than the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for 
delivering the message to the intended recipient, is prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please immediately 
notify us by calling Adam Rosenfeld at (212) 716-3245 or email to 

NOTICE: Unless a contrary intent is expressly stated in this email, the contents of this email and any attachments are 
being transmitted for discussion purposes only and shall not be deemed an offer, acceptance or rejection of any offer, nor 
binding upon the sender, our clients or the party on behalf of whom this email was sent. 
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