From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
Subject: Re: Dr Magnani
Date: Thu, 29 Jan 2015 11:23:09 +0000

of course wehere ar e You

On Thu, Jan 29, 2015 at 6:21 AM, | NN i
Dear Jeffrey , Magnam sent the office this mvoice. It is 5645 total and was for me to have my teeth cleaned
and a filling redone. Would 1t be ok for Bella to pay 1t?
Thank you xo

Sent from my 1Phone

Begin forwarded message:

From: bellaklein *_:-e
Date: January 28, 2015 at 8:50:57 PM GM

To: [N I -

Subject: Dr Magnani

B plcase confirm your visit and procedure with Dr. Magnani. Please provide JE approval,

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

Begin forwarded message:

To:
Subject: Message from KMBT C253
From:
Reply-To:
Date: January 28, 2015 at 3:21:31 PM EST

please note
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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