
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Denali 
Date: Thu, 15 Jan 2015 13:34:45 +0000 

yes 

On Thu, Jan 15, 2015 at 9:26 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
please advise if ok to pay balance due of 52,412 on denali 

total cost with registration and road tax 77,412 
less: deposit (25,000) 
balance due 52,412 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Neilia122 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Howard Richards < 
To: < 
Subjec: ou ern rust 
Date: January 12. 2015 at 3:42:02 PM EST 

Good afternoon-
Upon review there was an error in my addition. 

When first quoted you had requested the Denali Touring package which was no longer available at time of 
ordering. 

GM recommended to add Denali Premium package and or Open road package, see GM print out. 

The increase is for these two packages. 

Ran the vin in the incentive code and came up with no incentives, see enclosed 

Regards 

Howard 

EFTA00866574



please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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