
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: Panel / shutter motor quote 
Date: Tue, 06 Jan 2015 20:32:56 +0000 

call me 340 775 8111 

On Tue, Jan 6, 2015 at 4:07 PM, Richard Kahn • wrote: 
i spoke with Karl from Protect and was able to negotiate his total cost of 12,938 to 12,000 
he has requested a 50% deposit 
lead time for materials is approximately 2 weeks and then install will take 3 days 
please advise if ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Fwd: Panel / shutter motor quote 
Date: January 6, 2015 at 12:07:10 PM EST 
To: Rich Kahn >, Daphne Wallace < 

se? 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: January 4, 2015 at 10:45:09 AM AST 
To: Ann Rodriquez
Subject: Re: Panel / shutter motor quote 

Ok 

On Sunday, January 4, 2015, Ann Rodriquez < > wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

Requested Bid to Electrify Master Bath: $2,018.00 
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Requested Bid for Hurricane Panels on Kite House & Blue Beach: $10,920.00 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Karl Gartner 
Date: January 4, 2015 at 9:42:40 AM AST 
To: 
Subject: Panel / shutter motor quote 
Reply-To: Karl Gartner <1 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00867234


