From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: Sophia
Date: Mon, 29 Dec 2014 23:05:40 +0000

1 will pay her personally fro dec 20 t1ll jan 29.  then she 15 gone

On Mon, Dec 29, 2014 at 4:51 PM, Richard Kahn -a—'-'-* wrote:
she has called and emailed Jeanne asking if from Dec 29th until when she begins work on January 10th she
will be paid
if so please advise which entity and i1 assume it will be as a subcontractor and based on 40,000/ 52 =

Jeanne mentioned this moming that Sophia has called and emailed her asking if she will be paid from Dec
20th (original start date) thru January 10th (estimated new start date)

If you choose to pay her please advise which entity as we discussed 1t would be as a subcontractor and based
on an annual figure of $40,000 / 52 weeks = 769.23 per week or 153.85 per day
If paid will we pay New Years Day Holhiday?

Please advise how 1 shall reply to Sophia

Thank you

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht" <||| | -

Subject: FW: Checking In
Date: December 29, 2014 at 11:10:12 AM EST
To: < -

Do you want me to respond in any way to her? Thanks

————— Original Message--—--

From: Sophia Mwaura || |

Sent: Saturday, December 27, 2014 12:16 PM
To: I

Subject: Checking In

Morning Jeanne,
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Hope you had a good Christmas and holiday season! | was just wondering 1f
vou had heard back from Jeffrey at all. Also did you get the email that |

forwarded?
-Sophia

Sent from my iPhone=

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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