
From: Richard Joslin
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: interest 
Date: Tue, 30 Dec 2014 18:10:52 +0000 

yes 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailtoleeyacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, December 30, 2014 1:10 PM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Subject: Re: interest 

did you send me email to bryan? 

On Tue, Dec 30, 2014 at 1:50 PM, Richard Joslin < > wrote: 

I reviewed with Rich D our open intra family/ entity notes and where interest is stipulated to be paid annually, 
interest has been paid or has been slated to be paid. As soon as EA lands we will tee up the final payment 
with US Trust. Also, Ben's note that was gifted to Yggdrasil Trust in 2012 was paid in full (with interest) in 
2013. 

Richard Joslin 
CFO 
Elysium Management LLC 
445 Park Ave 
Ste. 1401 
New York, NY 10022 
(w)
(c) 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 

EFTA00867970



destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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