From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: Lesley Groff <[
Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 17 Dec 2014 01:11:28 +0000

ok

On Tue, Dec 16, 2014 at 6:51 PM. Lesley Groff ~_* wrote:

B cickct is booked. .. am still waiting for the confirm... but it 1s done with the return on march 24. ..

total $1343.40

On Dec 16, 2014, at 4:18 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

book the ticket ﬁ}r- for tomorw. thanks
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