
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Joslin

Subject: Re: 
Date: Fri, 07 Nov 2014 15:58:46 +0000 

why is mealnies funding related in any way to estimated cash flow?? silly 

On Fri, Nov 7, 2014 at 11:57 AM, Richard Joslin < > wrote: 
I assumed we would be more steady state in 2015 given all the heavy lifting in legal work in 2014 and 
bringing in Heather Gray to cover Withers et al services. I know that Leon often does not pay such as fees for 
Artspace negotiation. Last since some legal fees have been paid by Melanie, the funding of 3MM a quarter to 
Leon would ostensibly included these amounts. That said, I should increase the estimate. 

On Nov 7, 2014, at 10:43 AM, "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

you estimated 200k for legal. total for 14 months. ? '1 9 9
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