From: Richard Kahn _}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Important - Statement
Date: Sat. 08 Nov 2014 02:10:56 +0000

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Tel
Fax

Cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: [
Date: November 7, 2014 at 8:29:04 PM EST

To: Richard Kahn < =, Bella Klein <||| . B¢!1: Klein

Subject: Important - Statement

To be honest [ am very confused by the statement you have sent me.

I need to have more understanding about it.

A lot of the items are not mine but are my work. Furniture for the apartments, not even my apartment, flowers
for 71st street. Why 1s this all being added up with my salary and my rent? Are things that I have put on my
credit card for apartments and 71st street added to a grand total that | have spent on personal things for the
year?

There are apartment rugs under net a porter which 1s a clothing store and looks like 1 have bought clothing for
this amount.

Food for all the girls under only my name.

MNails? - I have never put a manicure on JE's account, it must be for one of the girls.

The Ralph Lauren amounts need to be worked out because most of this was either paid back in cash or taken
back. (I do see that there are some credits from it)

Rushmeyers birthday dinner for J|? This was not a birthday dinner for me! this is 1/3 [Jj and i} and -
All of the montauk hotel on my name? And no mention of and > Why are these items not divided?
This was asked for of Jeffrey by [l and . 1 would never have asked and although I was very fortunate to
be included and it is 1/3rd my expense why is it not divided?

I will go through the statements for all this time myself and take account for it more accurately. Please let me
know when this is needed by because although you think 1t takes an hour, it will take me far more time. The
application that you feel 'can wait' 1s for Parsons Design School where applications have already closed. It is
very important for my future here so it would be helpful to me, and greatly appreciated, if vou could simply let
me know whether vou need this before monday.

Thank vou
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