
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Russell Hernandez

Subject: Re: 
Date: Mon, 05 Mar 2018 13:31:24 +0000 

i tried to call it says your voicemail is not set up yet 

On Mon, Feb 26, 2018 at 2:23 PM, Russell Hernandez < > wrote: 
By the way this is not preconstruction this is maintenance 

Got it would you like me stop all that we are doing ?? 

no juice would equal weeks/months not days 

Not sure what results you would like from us as a gauge? 

I'm available by phone to finalize 

Russell Hernandez 

On Feb 26, 2018, at 2:11 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

russell this bid is the same one . what about quality , did anyone see any of their work. look im sorry its 
obvious -- we have no juice at cat puerto rico though we were clearly told otherwise. lets put a pin in 
today. new york zero and island close to zero.. if not really zero. I know you are better than this.. 
when rich raised the issue of why 35k . where is our savings. I told him it was worth it to buy juice.. 1 . 
I will agree to pay you another 35 only after i have seen results. I know that on construction you will be 
invaluable. . preconstruction , it appears not . . brian . caterpillir. too much for me. 

On Mon, Feb 26, 2018 at 1:35 PM, Russell Hernandez < > wrote: 
yes we have the revised price for the extension(attached) it should be 100k mark has been talking to them 

Trees we are getting price this week we were promised by tomorrow 

pedro has gone to the CAT company 2xs and once today to get their report and pricing that was promised 
to us last friday they are telling him we will have this week we are trying to get it today 

i can only get that tile you saw in LSJ in 24x24 36x36 would be a special order and could take 6-8 weeks 
we are sourcing other tile that is readily available in 36x36 we will pick up and send to LSJ 

not sure on hardware i will find out 

irrigation is still being repaired mark went through with them last weekend 
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On Mon, Feb 26, 2018 at 11:07 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
do we have bids on the guest house extension on GSJ.? if not when? I want to start. !! it seems 
nothing has happened at all. . main compound. landscape? trees? irrigation? hardware? news? 
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