
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: 2014-09-22 Steptoe invoice no. 2521895 to Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Wed, 01 Oct 2014 15:36:54 +0000 

total 

On Wed, Oct 1, 2014 at 11:36 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 
please advise if i am paying total outstanding of 27,212.64 or current month balance of 13,625 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Sep 30, 2014, at 6:08 PM, Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

Ok 

 Forwarded message 
From: Bogdonoff, Philip  
Date: Tuesday, September 30, 2014 
Subject: 2014-09-22 Steptoe invoice no. 2521895 to Jeffrey Epstein 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein  (jeevacation@gmail.com)" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: "West, Philip" -4 

Hello Mr. Epstein, 

Attached is Steptoe's invoice for services rendered through August 31. Unless otherwise requested, we are emailing 
this electronic version only. 

Please contact us if you have any questions. 

Best regards, 

— Philip B. 

Philip Bogdonoff 
Legal Executive Assistant 
to Philip R. West 

Steptoe 
Steptoe & Johnson LLP 
1330 Connecticut Avenue, NW 

EFTA00869333



Washington, DC 20036 
+1 202 828-3622 

This message and any attached documents contain information from the law firm Steptoe 8 Johnson LLP that may be confidential and/or privileged. 
If you ate not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, distribute, or use this information. If you have received this transmission in error. 
please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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