
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Billing 
Date: Mon, 03 Feb 2014 21:24:25 +0000 

Attachments: Billing.2.3.14.pdf 

attached is W. Chester Breweer Jan 2014 invoice in the amount of 9,488.43 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Billing 
Date: February 3, 2014 3:30:25 PM EST 
To: 

See attached the February billing. 
Charlene Griffith, FRP 
Paralegal for the Firm 
W. Chester Brewer, Jr., M. 

Lll L ission is legally privileged and confidential, intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby requested to destroy this message and 
refrain from disseminating it in any way. Any inadvertent transmission of any attorney client privileged 
communication or any attorney work product shall not be deemed a waiver of any applicable privilege or 
protection, in accordance with applicable law. If you receive this communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
telephone (collect if necessary). 

EFTA00871189


