
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: Mon, 16 Dec 2013 16:31:58 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice, 12-2-13.doc 

> 

Marty outstanding: 21,168 

nov billing 
prior 

250.00 
20,918.00 

last paid 25,000 on 11/6/2013 

please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Martin Weinberg" < 
Subject: Fw: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: December 16, 2013 11:22:02 AM EST 
To: "Rich Kahn" < 
Cc: 

> 

> 

Richard 
Are you intending to pay the 12-2 invoice which consists almost exclusively in fees generated by 
prior months legal work before 12-31. Would be appreciated. 
Marty 

Original Message 
From: Martin Weinberg 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeffery Edwards • 
Sent: Monday, December 02, 2013 9:01 AM 
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL 

Richard 
The monthly invoice which is almost exclusively a carry forward from prior month's is attached. 
Thanks 
Marty 
Martin G. Weinberg 
MARTIN G. WEINBERG, PC 

EFTA00871776



(FAX) 

**************************************************************************** 

This Electronic Message contains information from the Law Office of Martin G. Weinberg, Ini., 
and may be privileged. The information is intended for the use of the addressee only. If you are 
not the addressee, please note that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents 
of this message is prohibited. 
********************************************* ******* irk ******** Irk ************ 
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