
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Life Insurance 
Date: Mon, 11 Nov 2013 19:51:24 +0000 

Yes 

On Mon, Nov 11, 2013 at 3:39 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
I received annual invoice for 5,000,000 policy in the amount of 9,382.40 for The JEE Life Insurance Trust #3 

is sole beneficiary 
This premium stays level at this amount until 2018 
Is it ok to pay? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 
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