From: [l Gro7 <N -
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: [ ticket came through!!
Date: Tue, 15 Oct 2013 15:06:42 +0000

I emailed Lynne back stating we can send them a reimbursement check. ;)
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lynne Meloccaro <
Date: October 15, 2013, 10:40:11 AM EDT

To: Lesley Groff = =
Ce: "Catherine Luiggi )" < -

Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein

HI
lcke[ is all set. [ put it on our credit card just to be sure we got it. The cost was $150. The ticket will

be waiting at the box office tonight under her name.

All best,

Lynne

Lynne Meloccaro
Executive Director

American Symphony Orchestra

Direct NN | Moin:

263 West 38 Street | 10th Floor | New York | NY | 10018

This message (and any attached files) 1s confidential and proprietary and 15 intended solely for the specific
addressee(s).

If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by reply email
and delete it and all backup copies immediately.

----- Original Message-----

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: | EEG_G___

Sent: Monday, October 14, 2013 3:23 PM

To: Lynne Meloccaro

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

Yes!! Correct! I will cross my fingers!! Thank you so much.

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 14, 2013, at 3:17 PM, Lynne Meloccaro <lmeloccarof@americansymphony.org> wrote:

Hi Leslie,
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Carnegie Hall's offices are off today. I will let you know first thing tomorrow morning. Just the one ticket,

yves?

All best,

Lynne

Lynne Meloccaro

Executive Director

American Symphony Orchestra
263 West 38th Street, 10th Floor
Mew York, NY 10018
direct: | N
main: | .

foax -

www. americansymphony.org

From: Lesley Groff [M—]

Sent: Monday, October 14, 2013 1:54 PM

To: Lynne Meloccaro

Subject: Jeffrey Epstein

Hi Lynne! Catherine kindly says vou are looking into a ticket for tomorrow nights concert for Jeffrey

Epstein!! Thank yvou so very much!! Please let me know if possible!

Thank vou!

Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein
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Sent from my iPhone
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