
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 15 Oct 2013 16:28:57 +0000 

i spoke with Eileen and she said wire will be sent his afternoon 
i will check with amanda at DB at send you confirmation once funds are received 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fan 
cell 

On Oct 14, 2013, at 6:27 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

did you hear back from eileen, call her if not, today is payment day 
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