
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: Mon, 26 Feb 2018 18:07:50 +0000 

Attachments: invoice_42231.pdf 

i left bill a message then sent him email below which erika responded to.. 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Erika Kellerhals 
Subject: Invoices for Blum work 
Date: February 26, 2018 at 12:08:06 PM EST 
To: " 

Rich — Bill's wife had 
questions or information you need. 

Erika A. Kellerhals 
Member 
Kellerhals Ferguson ICroblin PLLC 

Is there an issue with the invoices? If so — feel free to email any 

Notice: This communication may contain privileged or other confidential information. If you are not the 
intended recipient, or believe that you have received this communication in error, please do not print, copy, re-
transmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please indicate to the sender that you have 
received this e-mail in error, and delete the copy you received. Thank you. 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: February 26, 2018 at 11:41:40 AM EST 
To: 

can you please call me to discuss attached invoice 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

 Forwarded message  
From: William Blum  
Date: Wed, Feb 21, 2018 at 2:58 PM 
Subject: Invoice 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(is omail.com> 
Cc: Erika Kellerhals  

Jeff, please see the invoice from Kellerhals Ferguson attached which shows the amount currently owing. 

Please confirm when payment has been sent and let us know if you need anything else. 

Thanks, 

Bill 

William Blum I Partner 

SOLOMON BLUM HEVMANN LIP 
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From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevS@gmail com 
Sent: Tuesday, February 20, 2018 5:02 PM 
To: William Blum 
Subject: 

Bill , governor not chipping in . - how much owed ? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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