
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL - JE 

Date: Mon, 22 Jul 2013 19:00:14 +0000 

yes ok 

On Mon, Jul 22, 2013 at 2:59 PM, wrote: 
attached is marty june invoice which it appears i did not present to you last week for payment 
confirming ok to pay marry june invoice in the amount of 40,700 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Martin Weinberg" <I 
Date: Jul 2 2013 9:42:15 AM EDT 
To: 
Cc: "Jeffery Edwards" <jeevacation@gmail.com>  
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL - JE 

An invoice for June's legal services. 
Marty 
Martin G. Weinberg 
MARTIN G. WEINBERG, PC 
20 Park Plaza, Suite 1000 

116 

FAX) 

**************************************************************************** 

This Electronic Message contains information from the Law Office of Martin G. Weinberg, 
and may be privileged. The information is intended for the use of the addressee only. If you are 
not the addressee, please note that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents 
of this message is prohibited. 
***************** ***** ************* ************* ******* ********** ******* 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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