From: brice gordon < N -
To: Richard Kahn <||

Ce: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationfgmail.com=
Subject: Re: Capt Bubbler
Date: Wed, 28 Feb 2018 13:36:28 +0000

ok, message has been sent

On Tue, Feb 27, 2018 at 3:04 PM, Richard Kahn <} | RN - o<

i need confirmation in writing that 20k is prepayment for barge runs and not money we are investing in his
other barge

idea 15 that money we are fronting him will allow him to get his other boat in service

additionally we must have regular scheduled runs with his current barge

Fachard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

fax

cell

On Feb 27, 2018, at 11:21 AM, brice gordon {—'-* wrote:

Rich
When can check be processed 7

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 27, 2018, at 8:38 AM, brice gordon f_ wrote:

Rich, can a check be processed this moming.

Anna can you make sure check gets to Bubbler today
Also can please confirm with him tomorrow or thursday schedule
thank you

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation{@gmail.com=>
Date: Tue, Feb 27, 2018 at 6:59 AM
Subject: Re: Capt Bubbler

To: brice gordon < EG—_TRR

pay
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On Tue, Feb 27, 2018 at 5:23 AM, brice gordon <||| - - ot::

Good Moming

I meet with Capt bubbler Friday mormning last week, and discussed the proposed deposit of 20K |, with condition he provides a cost

for a PR Palm Run and was able to give us at least one complete run per week
He indicated if we payed him the 20, his second barge would be operational in 1 to 2 weeks

He also indicated he could our organize our trash runs. On Saturday noon, i spoke with him and confirmed we need the cost for

PR Palm run before we would release the Deposit.
He indicated he could do a Run on Sunday,!!!

| also texted him this weeks barge run

| have called, but no response.

RHto L8]

| x Lull

Ix Flat bed tropical, could be two
Ix Fuel Truck

Spetic Pump

Trash Truck

LS) o (GS)
I x Mini Ex
I % Lull

LSJto RH
Flat bed
Spetic Truck
Spetic Pump

Do we pay him the 20K, even thou he has not indicated the cost of PR run and confirmed when he can do our runs.
please note as discussed the MC Spetic will most likely over flow by next week.

How do you wish to proceed.

regards Brice

Brice Gordon

please note
The imformation contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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Brice Gordon

Brice Gordon
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