
From: "Peggy Siegal" < 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: Fwd: Fw: Mother's Estate 

Date: Sun, 23 Dec 2012 22:54:43 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Did I send this to you? I got a check for $25,000 with a form to sign that I have received it and send back. Why $25,000? 

I actually saw Mattie on Friday. She came to my apartment to get some of her clothes. We went shopping. I haven't seen 
her since May. She behaved like it was nothing. She was just busy. She did find the time to pick out a gold jacket and a 
white curly wool coat for $1,200.00....she looked adorable. She is a drummer in a band called "Lunchbox"....four guys and 
her. 
The are in the process of recording an album. 

Can I make this up? She has gigs in Brooklyn bars in Janurary. You are coming with me....maybe you can find a wife in 
Brooklyn. 

When am I coming to visit you. Geffen arrives on the 29th. I am emailing him now. Ovitz is here on his boat with Tamara 
Mellon. 
Buffet is in the harbor. Afraid to email Harvey Weinstein. If he comes, he will torment me. Peg 
xoxo Peg 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

From: 
Date: Fri, 21 Dec 2012 11:41:50 -0500 (EST) 
To: 
Cc: < >; 
Subject: Fwd: Fw: Mother's Estate 

>: < 

Dear Peggy, 
Under separate cover, this week I have forwarded you a note indicating that Bederson & Co. are in the process of reviewing all 
the final numbers, which will be forwarded to you shortly. 
In addition, I have enclosed a distribution check, please sign Receipt Of Beneficiary Form, and return to me. 
Thank you, 
Gary 

Gary Siegal 
Satco Products, Inc. 
(201) 9474884- Phone 
(201) 947-4820- Fax 
(201) 290-0233- Mobile 

From: 
To: 
Sent: 12/21/2012 9:36:22 MI. Eastern Standard Time 
Subj: Fw: Mother&apos:s Estate 

-----Original Message-----
From: Peggy Siegal 
To: Garysiegal 

EFTA00876125



To: Garysiia l 
ReplyTo: 
Subject: Mother's Estate 
Sent: Dec 21, 2012 5:52 AM 

Dear Gary: 
Hope this email finds you well....and you enjoy the holidays. 

#1. Please send me the accounting for the estate. This is past due. 

#2. My calculations are that I am owed the following on the 4.9 million dollar estate; 

which includes a loan to you of 250k that was made while mom was in the hospital in December before her death in February. 

minus expenses which also include the 90k that you took as executor. 

4.9 million dollars - 700 equals approximately 4.2 

minus the 800 already paid...equals 3.4 million dollars 

half of which is 1.7 million dollar additional, which I have received so far 450k. 

So an additional check of 1,250,000 should be sent to me asap. 

Afterwards we will need to resolve hopefully amicably the 500k difference of the million that you as trustee of dad's trust are 
legally responsible for letting mom take from us. 
Peggy 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

EFTA00876126


