
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: FTC Check 
Date: Fri, 23 Sep 2011 19:31:00 +0000 

ok 

On Fri, Sep 23, 2011 at 2:43 PM, Richard Kahn
Attached check was processed from FTC in the amount of $10,000 
Is it ok to release? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fa 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: September 23, 2011 2:42:14 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT_C253 
Reply-To: 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

> wrote: 

EFTA00878304


