
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: FW: 
Date: Wed, 05 Jan 2011 23:25:02 +0000 

ok 

On Wed, Jan 5, 2011 at 5:00 PM, Rich Kahn < > wrote: 

Attached is invoice for Hotel Rooms, Food/Beverage, Resort Fee and Tax at Ritz totaling $68,734.18 

Cecile already left a deposit in the amount $12,894.73 

Balance Due: $55,837.45 

Is this ok to pay? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: Una Pascal 
Seat: Tuesday, January 04, 2011 12:03 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeanne Brennan; 
Subject: 

Hi Rich, 

Please process check for Mind Shift Conference. This is needed prior to the group 
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arrival to the Hotel. 

Thanks, 

Una 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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