From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
To: |
Subject: Re: (no subject)
Date: Sat, 02 May 2009 17:43:44 +0000

now [N
On Sat, May 2, 2009 at 12:06 PM, mark lloyd *—-“-* wrote:

Hi Jeffrey,
Tried calling this number, but to no avail. When would be conbenient to call again?

Sent from my BlackBerryE wireless device

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: Sat, 2 May 2009 08:25:21 -0400

To: <[ -

Subject: Re: (no subject)

ok then, at 12 my time

On Sat, May 2, 2009 at 7:53 AM, mark lloyd fi_'* wrote:

Will do so 1in 1 hour as in lunch

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device

From: Jeevacation

Date: Fri, 1 Mav 2000 07:46:03 -0400
To: I S

Subject: Re: (no subject)

Sent from my 1Phone

On May 1, 2009, at 11:49 AM, "mark lloyd" fi_'* wrote:

An envelope with the key is with the Monitor Group reception desk with _numc on it.

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: Fri, | May 2009 11:41:04 -0400
To: < - T ——

Subject: Re: (no subject)

- could vou photo this flat for me thanks address 7 sorry phone for vou office 7

On Fri, May 1, 2009 at 11:16 AM, mark lloyd <] G- v otc:
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[ will be happy to arrange that. [ will have a key waiting for their collection at my office (Monitor Group,
.lam in § of France, but just give me his/her
name and it will be in an envelope with the reception desk. If they could please return it afterwards.

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Date: Fri, 1| May 2009 09:16:21 -0400
To: < >

Subject: Re: (no subject)

[ would like a friend to go to apt and photograph

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 6:03 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationfwgmail.com™> wrote:
ok

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 5:53 PM, mark lloyd {—“-* wrote:

Jeffrey,

Impossible to extract myself to call, so will do so tomorrow!

As ever,

Mark

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Date: Wed, 29 Apr 2009 13:09:49 0400

Subject: Re: (no subject)

http:/f'www.sothebysrealty.com/en/PropertyDetails aspx?

R=100121572&N=12+149+42849671 72 &curr=USD&lang=en&No=13&PSeg=10

On Wed, Apr 29, 2009 at 9:56 AM, 'f_ wrote:
Thanks , but | have attached herewith the note from Paula's secretary (who is based in Miami) and pays all
the bills etc.

From: LIRMIA

To: WMARKLLOYD

Sent: 29/04/2009 14:48:45 GMT Daylight Time
Subj: Re: (no subject)

1) the lease is owned by Paula
2) Quarterly fees: 1,140.18 GBP

Regards,
Lorraine

Access 350+ FREE radio stations anytime from anywhere on the web. Get the Radio Toolbar!
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Big savings on Dell XPS Laptops and Desktops!
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