From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn <
Subject: Re: wire

Date: Tue, 13 Feb 2018 22:12:41 +0000

Yes
On Tue, Feb 13, 2018 at 4:45 PM Richard Kahn < = wrote:
confirming ok to begin first month of $7,000 USD to

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cel

please note
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