
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Gary Kemey 

Subject: Re: Gensler 

Date: Sat, 29 Aug 2009 13:45:16 +0000 

>, Rich Kahn

you decide 

On Sat, Aug 29, 2009 at 9:41 AM, Gary Kerney < > wrote: 
Jeffery 

Of the billing to date $5,000 is for the ATV garage. 

I would not hold up payment of $105,500 searching whether Gensler had direction from the team that added tunnels and 
office below the main house. That's past. 

I recommend we go forward ,payment and the contract will help overcome the apprehension I sense on Gensler being 
comfortable with proceeding or communicate with me , as well as aiding in my negotiating the fees for the major changes 
to structure when we do meet. 

Direction? 
Gary 
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