
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Bella Klein

Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal 

Date: Mon, 31 Aug 2009 17:18:36 +0000 

ok 

On Mon, Aug 31, 2009 at 1:16 PM, Bella Klein -4 

Date of departure is September 4 

> wrote: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtoleevacationegmail com 
Sent: Monday, August 31, 2009 1:16 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal 

for what dates, 

On Mon, Aug 31, 2009 at 1:14 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Dear Jeffrey, 

I see a charge on Amex on 8/26 for $3,003.80 from Delta Airlines for Peggy Siegal travel Naples — Venice — Brussels. 

I spoke to and Rich about the charge and neither is aware about it. Did you authorize this payment? 

Thank you 

Bella. 
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