
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: Money 
Date: Thu, 15 Feb 2018 12:56:33 +0000 

Looking forward to it, Sir. 

Best re arils, 

On 15 Feb 2018, at 13:55, jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

unlikely maybe aprilor may 

On Thu, Feb 15, 2018 at 7:41 AM, 
Sic thank you so much. 

Will I see you on 15th of March? 

wrote: 

Best re arils, 

On 15 Feb 2018, at 13:39, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

ok I will send you 3k euros. reach out when you need more. good luck 

On Thu, Feb 15, 2018 at 6:53 AM, • wrote: 
I am at Glion right now. 

Going to Russia, Ekaterinburg today at 9:40 PM until Sunday. 

Arriving to Barcelona at 11:20 AM on Sunday 18th of Feb and checking into the apartment. 

On Monday 19th of Feb starting the internship until 21st of August. 

On Monday I have to pay a deposit worth 1100E (It's a law in Spain. You have to pay a deposit worth 2 
months of rent for a fully furnished apartment), which will be refunded on the day of the checkout. 

+ The monthly rent is 550 E plus 50 E(utilities). 

The same amount as we talked about previously, Sir. 

Yes, I asked for a transfer, because of the luggage. Thank you very much! 

Best re ards 

On 15 Feb 2018, at 12:05, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
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Where are you ? Amount ? Plan? organized car . Going to Barcelona today? 

On Thu, Feb 15, 2018 at 1:17 AM 
Good morning, Sir. 

> wrote: 

I am sorry to annoy you with this topic, but could the wire be sent this week in order for me to pay for 
rent next Monday? Otherwise I will be left without a place to stay in Barcelona. 

Best re ards 
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