
From: 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevaeation(kgrnail.corn> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Mon, 12 Feb 2018 16:39:57 +0000 

it helps although I have that much on credit cards already. Can do it as income if that makes a difference.. Last year's transfers can also be claimed as income on 
my end.. 
thank you 

From: jeffre E. <'eevacalion mail.com> 
To: IM < 
Sent: Monday, February 12, 2018 11:10 AM 
Subject: Re: 

will send 25k . . is that ok.? 

On Mon, Feb 12, 2018 at 11:08 AM, b wrote: 
So the double balance is only 17.087 since August. Turns out not being able to travel internationally is problematic for a pilot, among other things.. 
I'm trying to hire a lawyer for a green card. file a patent application. pay credit cards. get plane fixed and hoping to freeze eggs soon. Is it possible to get an 
advance on future doubles to help move things along? I can offer continuing education for Russian girlfriends..:) 
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