
From: Valeria Chomsky

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Cc: Noam Chomsky 

Subject: THANK YOU !!! 

Date: Thu, 08 Feb 2018 02:52:16 +0000 

This is a great result and a very fast negotiation. 

As I have worked in the financial market, I knew what Bainco did could have put them in jail. 

But we needed you to show who was in the driver's seat. The story would be left were it was, without Noam 
seeing one cent from his money back. And without anyone moving one finger to do anything about it: including 
Max; Deborah -- our lawyer, who told Noam he shouldn't do anything about it, when Gene (from her office) 
advise us that something was very wrong and something should be done; Nick -- our accountant. Absolutely no 
one would have done anything. But you. 

We know that there is not enough to compensate for all you have been doing for us, but we would like if you 
would retain whatever percentage you think appropriate for all the time you have been putting in this particular 
case. 

Many thanks. 

Valeria 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Feb 7, 2018 at 7:57 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Noam Chomsky 
To: Valeria Chomsky   Noam Chomsky  

 Forwarded message   
From: Richard Kahn <1 
Date: Wed, Feb 7, 2018 at 5:02 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Noam Chomsky 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kelly, William" 
Subject: Noam Chomsky 
Date: February 7, 2018 at 5:01:07 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Sam Bain 

For Settlement Purposes Only 

Dear Rich: 

Bainco has authorized me to confirm that it will meet your demand with respect to Noam's investments in private equity 
partnerships at Bainco. Our understanding is that Noam invested a total of $267,500 (through his revocable trust and 
his IRA) and received a tax benefit of approximately $27,000 due to realized capital losses, resulting in a net investment 
of $240,500. Bainco will pay that amount to Noam and Noam will relinquish his entire interest in the private equity 
partnerships (a portion of the settlement amount may be paid through a third party's purchase of Noam's interest in the 
RFID partnerships at his original purchase price). The settlement agreement will include mutual releases and standard 
non-disclosure and non-disparagement provisions. Please confirm at your earliest convenience and I will prepare the 
settlement agreement for your review. 

Regards, 
Bill 

Pubtp://www.nixon1 
William E Kelly 
Senior Counsel 

Nixon Peabody LLP 
@NixonPeabodyLLP 

Boston MA 02110-2131 
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Please consider the environment before printing this email. 
This email message and any attachments are confidential and may be protected by the attorney/client or other applicable privileges. The information is intended 
to be conveyed only to the designated recipient(s) of the message. If you are not an intended recipient. please notify the sender immediately and delete the 
message from your email system. Unauthorized use. dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message by other than the intended recipient is strictly 
prohibited and may be unlawful. Thank you. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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